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<4 1119AM Gmail - Fwd: Required spare parts for Slit Lamp.

M Gma” SMO Gurdaspur <smodhgsp@gmail.com>
Fwd: Required Spare parts for Slit Lamp.

1 message

Manjit Singh <manjit.aov@gmail.com> Mon, Aug 12, 2024 at 11:16 AM

To: 'smodhgsp@gmail.com" <smodhgsp@gmail.com>

—— Forwarded message ---—---

From: SUNIL RANA <store.pb@aovinternational.net>

Date: Mon, Aug 12, 2024. 9:47 AM

Subject: Re: Required spare parts for Siit Lamp.

To: <manjit.aov@gmail.com>

Cc: Mamun Sirajee <mamun@aovinternational.net>, SN Sahy <SNSahu@aovexports.com>, Pawan Negi
“Pawan.negi@aovinternational.net>, Rahul Dadhwal <rahu!.d@aovinternalional.net>. Renu Dheer
<Cph.punjab@aovinternational.net>, Rajan Rajan '=rajan.zharnritsar@aovinternational.net>, Devesh Kumar
<devesh@aovinternational.net>

Dear Manjit Ji

Please process for the RBER.

|Asset Name: SLIT LAMP
Asset Make : CARL ZEISS
Asset Model: SL-130
Asset Serial No: 825099
Barcode: 2080120166
L Quote Ref. No. Description Date Qty | Price | Amount
L 11-08-2024 5 STEP HEAD 11-08-2024 1 | 70000 70000
11-08-2024 EYE PIECES 11-08-2024| 1 |373000| 373000
11-08-2024 CHINREST ASSEMBLY (11-08-2024| 1 | 58000 58000
11-08-2024 SERVICE VISIT CHARGE [11-08-2024| 1 | 20000 20000
SER/PB/2024-25/000138 SERVICE VISIT CHARGE |27-06-2024| 1 | 20000 20000
Total Spend Value 541000
Asset Value 250000
% of Spend Value 216%

On Sat, Aug 10, 2024 at 11:39 AM SUNIL RANA <store.pb@aovinternational.net> wrote:
Dear Devesh Ji

Please Generate PO PI009956 on an urgent basis. call is under penalty. H

On Wed, Aug 7, 2024 at 6:35 PM SUNIL RANA <store.pb@aovinternational.net> wrote: f
Dear Devesh Ji

@c_ v
\ii .
Please Generate PO PI009956 Ef\
t’:\
i
--------- Forwarded message --------- ﬁ,ﬁ-\\
¢! \\
\

From: Manjit Singh <manjit.aov@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Aug 5, 2024 at 9:27 PM

Subject: Required spare parts for Slit Lamp., _ NN
To: <store.pb@aovinternational.net>, Sumit Sumit <store.punjab@aovinternatibnal.net>

Cc: <technicalhead.punjab@aovinternational.net>, <dph.punjab@aovinternational.net>,
<trc.punjab@aovinternational.net>, <rajan.zhamritsar@aovinternational.net>

https:ﬁmaiLgoogre‘comfmai|;uf0/?ik=f72be03d3f&view=pl&searchzall&permlh}d=lhread-f: 18071595000193532718&simpl=msg-f:18071595000193 ... 1/2




-8“ 2/24. 11:19AM Gmall - Fwd: Required spare parts for Slit Lamp.

Dear Sir,

Ticket no. PB25520
Barcode number: 2080120166

Machine Name: Slit Lamp

Make:

Location: DH Gurdaspur

District: Gurdaspur

Required spare: Chinnrest assembly Qty. 1
Eye Head Qty. 1

Eye piece Qty. 1 set

As per discussion with user this complaint attend by the OEM Engineer and he found some spare parts are need
to be Replaced. Please find attached picture for your reference.

Thanks & Regards
Manjit Singh
Gurdaspur Di

Thanks & Regards

Sunil Rana

AQV International LLP #986,

First Floor, Sector — 82, Mohali - 160055
(India) Mob : +91-9779885584

Email: store.pb@aovinternational.net

Thanks & Regards
- Sunil Rana
- AOV International LLP #986,
* First Floor, Sector — 82, Mohali - 160055
 (India) Mob : +91-9779885584
. Email: store.pb@aovinternational.net

Thanks & Regards

Sunil Rana

AOV International LLP #986,

First Floor, Sector — 82, Mohali - 160055
(India) Mob : +91-9779885584

Email: store.pb@aovinternational.net
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11-08-2024

Carl Zeiss India (Bangalore) Pvt. Ltd., Bangalore
AOV INTERNATIONAL LLP.

FIRST FLOOR PLOT NO 986 JLPL INDUSTRIAL

SECTOR 82 MOHALI
Punjab INDIA

Quotation

REPAIR OF CARL ZEISS MEDICAL EQUIPMENT

ZEISN

Regd. Office:

Carl Zeiss India
(Bangalore) Pvt. Ltd.

Plot No.3, Bommasandra
Jigani Link Road 560099
Bangalore

Sno. Description Quantity Unit Price without | Amount
! GST |
| 1. Chin rest unit, assembled SL120_130_160 1 58000/- | 58000/-
2. Parallel Tube F=140mm with eye piece 1 373000/- | 373000/-
3. Fixation Light 1 70000/- | 70000/-
2. Service Visit Charges 1 20000/- | 20000/-
Total 521000/-
IGST@18% 93780/-
Grand Total: 614780/-
This offer is valid until: 31/08/2024.

Carl Zeiss India (Bangalore) Pvt Ltd (Re,
free: 1800 103 0403 Tel +918

gd.office], Plot No 3, ligani Link Road, Bommasandra Industrial
04940 5747 E-mall: customercare.indla@zelss.com

Area, Bangalore-560 099, INDIA. Toll
Website: www.zeiss.co.in






