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12/16/23, 12:25 PM AQV INTERNATIONAL Mail - ECG Machine's sent to Allengers for Repairing purposes

r‘v Rahul Dadhwal <technicalhead.punjab@aovinternational.net>

ECG Machine's sent to Allengers for Repairing purposes

Devesh Kumar <devesh@aovinternational.net>
To: SUNIL RANA <store.pb@aovinternational.net>

Cc: TRC TRC <trc.punjab@aovinternational.net>, Renu Dheer <dph.punjab@aovinternational.net>, Rahul Dadhwal

<rahul.d@aovinternational.net>, Vikas Tomer <technicalhead.punjab@aovinternational.net>, Sumit Sumit

<store.punjab@aovinternational.net>
Dear Sunil Ji,

Please find below mentioned detail for RBER.

Mon, Oct 16, 2023 at 4:16 PM

Asset Name: ECG MACHINE
Asset Make : ALLENGER
Asset Model: PISCES -A-103
Asset Serial No: 2ZK1200519150-P
Barcode: 4020030041
Quote Ref. No. Description Date Qty Price Amount
STD/PB/2023-24/000365 DISPLAY 23-06-2023 1 7000 7000
SER/PB/2023-24/000107 ey ngfs’;l‘;;‘h S 19-06-2023 1 4800 4800
AGHPL/SRV/CHD/2023- ; e
24/H0-030 Printer 16-10-2023 1 7000 7000
AGHPL/SRV /CHD /2023- i
24/H0-030 Component Charge 16-10-2023 1 795 795
AGHPL/SRV/CHD /2023- ; i
24/H0-030 Service Charge 16-10-2023 1 1500 1500
Total Spend Value 21095
Asset Value 24581
% of Spend Value 86%
Thanks
Devesh Kumar

On Mon, Oct 16, 2023 at 1:32 PM SUNIL RANA <store.pb@aovinternational.net> wrote:

Quoted text hide
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rate Office:

Allengers

Passion for excellence web

GST NO: 03AAECAB7T66G2ZM
Pan No. :- AAECAB766G

Proforma Invoice

AGHPL/SRV/CHD/2023-24/HO-030

To,
AQV International
Mohali

Sub: - Proforma Invoice ECG Machie Repair Charge

Dear Sir

Corpo

5.C.0. 212-213-214, Sector 34-A
Chandigarhn-U.T.- 160 022 (INDIAY
E-mall : global.enguiries@allengers. nat
Twww. allengers.com

CIN : U24239DL2004PTC120158

EPBAX
Fax I+D1=172-2621912

TOLL FREE NO. 1000-266-8800

1 491-172-6618000-99
+01-172-2621913

Dated: - 16.10.2023

We are pleased to submit the proforma invoice of the ECG Machine Sr. No.-2K1206519150-P Repair

Charge as below:-
Amount GST
Sr. No. Description Price (InRs.) | Qty Total (In Rs.)

(InRs.) (%)

1 Printer Charges 7000 1 7000 12 7840

2 Component Charge 795 1 795 12 890

3 Service Charge 1500 1 1500 18 1770

TOTAL 10500/-

Bank details are as :
Name of the company: Allengers Global Healthcare (P) Ltd.

Name of the bank: HDFC Bank
Address of Bank: SCO 78-79, Sector 8C, Chandigarh
Account No.: :50200022753288
IFSC Code: HDFCO000107
Thanking you,

FOR ALLENGERS GLOBAL HEALTHCARE PVT.LTD.
[ 0.2 >

(AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY)
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